

BID OPENING: June 18, 2018

BIDDER

SALE OF VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT

Jamie Zentmyer
721 Maple Street
Waynesboro, PA 17268

1996 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton Truck - NO BID
1997 Ford F-700 Dump Truck - **\$1,201.00**
2002 Dodge Neon Sedan - **\$801.00**
2004 Dodge Caravan - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (no deck) - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID
John Deere Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID

Ronnie Hilton
717-977-9324

1996 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton Truck - **\$251.00**
1997 Ford F-700 Dump Truck - **\$201.00**
2002 Dodge Neon Sedan - **\$205.00**
2004 Dodge Caravan - **\$101.00**
Toro WH Riding Mower (no deck) - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID
John Deere Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID

Mike Cermak
Waynesboro Water Works, LLC
324 W. Main Street
Waynesboro, PA 17268

1996 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton Truck - **\$305.81**
1997 Ford F-700 Dump Truck - NO BID
2002 Dodge Neon Sedan - NO BID
2004 Dodge Caravan - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (no deck) - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID
John Deere Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID

Chris Potts
4320 Lincoln Way East
Fayetteville, PA 17222

1996 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton Truck - NO BID
1997 Ford F-700 Dump Truck - **\$192.58**
2002 Dodge Neon Sedan - **\$401.77**
2004 Dodge Caravan - **\$109.76**
Toro WH Riding Mower (no deck) - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID
John Deere Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID

Kerry Smith
7244 Anthony Highway
Waynesboro, PA 17268

1996 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton Truck - NO BID
1997 Ford F-700 Dump Truck - NO BID
2002 Dodge Neon Sedan - NO BID
2004 Dodge Caravan - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (no deck) - **\$31.00**
Toro WH Riding Mower (w/deck) - **\$31.00**
John Deere Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID

Melissa Johns
685 Pine Mountain Drive
Fayetteville, PA 17222

1996 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton Truck - NO BID
1997 Ford F-700 Dump Truck - **\$502.00**
2002 Dodge Neon Sedan - NO BID
2004 Dodge Caravan - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (no deck) - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID
John Deere Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID

Jamie Shindledecker
8113 Mentzer Gap Road
Waynesboro, PA 17268

1996 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton Truck - **\$300.00**
1997 Ford F-700 Dump Truck - NO BID
2002 Dodge Neon Sedan - **\$200.00**
2004 Dodge Caravan - **\$100.00**
Toro WH Riding Mower (no deck) - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID
John Deere Riding Mower (w/deck) - NO BID

John Baumgardner
11315 Baumgardner Lane
Waynesboro, PA 17268

1996 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton Truck - NO BID
1997 Ford F-700 Dump Truck - **\$857.00**
2002 Dodge Neon Sedan - NO BID
2004 Dodge Caravan - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (no deck) - **\$40.00**
Toro WH Riding Mower (w/deck) - **\$46.00**
John Deere Riding Mower (w/deck) - **\$52.00**

Kyle Grimes
10325 Blue Rock Road
Waynesboro, PA 17268

1996 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton Truck - NO BID
1997 Ford F-700 Dump Truck - NO BID
2002 Dodge Neon Sedan - NO BID
2004 Dodge Caravan - NO BID
Toro WH Riding Mower (no deck) - **\$60.00**
Toro WH Riding Mower (w/deck) - **\$60.00**
John Deere Riding Mower (w/deck) - **\$60.00**